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QUOTE SHEET 

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES 

Company: 

Quote Prepared by: 

Date: 

Unit Name Contract Acres per acre rate unit total 

Altha Unit 1 92.2 
Altha Unit 2 1.7 
Altha Unit 3 12.9 
Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree 
Removal* 12.5 *lump sum bid

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8 
Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 *lump sum bid

Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1 
Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3 
Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1 
Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 *lump sum bid

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0 
Hobbs Unit 2 147.5 
Hobbs Unit 3 73.1 
Hobbs Unit 4 119.1 
Hobbs Unit 5 61.1 
Hobbs Unit 6 32.3 
Hobbs Unit 7 52.5 
Hobbs Unit 8 40.0 
Authorized Signature 

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020 

Promise Habitat Services, LLC

Brannen Willis

08/14/2020

$4,250.00 $111.775.00

$1,449.00
$1,449.00
 $1,449.00

$133,597.80

$2,463.30

$18,692.10

$1790.00

$1790.00

$1800.00
$1800.00

$227,330.00

$130,849.00

$58,140.00
$94,500.00
No Quote

No Quote
No Quote

No Quote

No Quote
No Quote

No Quote
No Quote
No Quote

No Quote

mailto:Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com
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REVISED QUOTE SHEET (August 12, 2020) 

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES 

Company: 

Quote Prepared by: 

Date: 

Unit Name 
Contract 

Acres 
per acre rate unit total 

Altha Unit 1  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 92.2 

Altha Unit 2  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 1.7 

Altha Unit 3  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 12.9 

Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree Removal* 12.5 *lump sum bid

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8 
Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 *lump sum bid

Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1 
Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3 

Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1 
Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 *lump sum bid

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0 
Hobbs Unit 2 147.5 
Hobbs Unit 3 73.1 
Hobbs Unit 4 102.5 
Hobbs Unit 5 61.1 
Hobbs Unit 6 32.3 
Hobbs Unit 7 52.5 
Hobbs Unit 8 40.0 

Authorized Signature 

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020 

$516,320.00

$9,520.00

$72,240.00

$326,100.00

$5,600.00

$5,600.00

$5,600.00

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid

No Bid

$5,600.00
$5,600.00
$5,600.00
$5,600.00
$5,600.00
$5,600.00
$5,600.00
$5,600.00

$711,200.00
$826,000.00
$409,360.00
$574,000.00
$342,160.00
$180,880.00
$294,000.00
$224,000.00

CrowderGulf Joint Venture, Inc. 

Reid Loper, Vice President 

08.13.2020

mailto:Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com
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QUOTE SHEET

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES 

Company:

Quote Prepared by: 

Date: 

Unit Name Contract Acres per acre rate unit total

Altha Unit 1 92.2   

Altha Unit 2 1.7 
Altha Unit 3 12.9   
Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree 
Removal* 12.5 *lump sum bid

  

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8 
Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 *lump sum bid   

Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1   

Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3   

Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1 
Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 *lump sum bid   

  

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0   

Hobbs Unit 2 147.5   

Hobbs Unit 3 73.1   

Hobbs Unit 4 119.1 
Hobbs Unit 5 61.1 
Hobbs Unit 6 32.3   

Hobbs Unit 7 52.5   

Hobbs Unit 8 40.0   

Authorized Signature

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020

Aftermath Disaster Recovery, Inc.

Melanie Corley

August 13, 2020

3,900

3,900

3,900

359,580

50,310

6,630

48,750

3,900 18,720

12,870

3,900 15,990

3,900 102,570

3,900 19,890

2,430

3,900

3,900

3,900

3,900
3,900

3,900

3,900

3,900

495,300

575,250

285,090

464,490

238,290

125,970

204,750

156,000
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REVISED QUOTE SHEET (August 12, 2020) 

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES  

Company: 

Quote Prepared by: 

Date: 

Unit Name 
Contract 

Acres 
per acre rate unit total 

Altha Unit 1  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 92.2     

Altha Unit 2  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 1.7     

Altha Unit 3  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 12.9     

Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree Removal* 12.5 *lump sum bid   

        

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8     

Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 *lump sum bid   

Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1     

Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3     

Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1     

Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 *lump sum bid   

        

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0    

Hobbs Unit 2 147.5    

Hobbs Unit 3 73.1    

Hobbs Unit 4 102.5     

Hobbs Unit 5 61.1     

Hobbs Unit 6 32.3     

Hobbs Unit 7 52.5     

Hobbs Unit 8 40.0     

Authorized Signature 

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020 

mailto:Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com
edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$7,400.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$7,400.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$7,400.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$28,787.33

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$4,800.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$3,300.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$3,300.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$3,700.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$3,500.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$3,800.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$4,000.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$3,800.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$3,800.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$2,990.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$2,990.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$2,990.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$275,678.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$5,083.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$38,571.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$35,520.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$30,340.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$126,240.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$37,740.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$419,100.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$486,750.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$270,470.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$358,750.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$232,180.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$129,200.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$199,500.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$152,000.00

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$7,487.33

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
$20,087.33

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
Collins Land Services, Inc.

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
Edwin R. Collins V.P.

edwin@collinslandservices.com
Typewritten text
8/13/2020



REVISED QUOTE SHEET (August 12, 2020) 

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES 
 

Company: Gordon and Porter Services, LLC 

Quote Prepared by: Jeff Porter 

Date: 8/14/2020 

Unit Name Contract 
Acres per acre rate unit total 

Altha Unit 1 (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 
be awarded to a single contractor) 92.2 $2950 $271,990 

Altha Unit 2 (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 
be awarded to a single contractor) 1.7 $2950 $5,015 

Altha Unit 3 (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 
be awarded to a single contractor) 12.9 $2950 $38,055 

Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree Removal* 12.5 *lump sum bid $253,000 

    

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8 $3500 $16,800 

Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 *lump sum bid $334,000 

Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1 No Bid No Bid 

Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3 No Bid No Bid 

Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1 $3500 $17,850 

Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 *lump sum bid $267,000 

    

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0 $3,200 $406,400 

Hobbs Unit 2 147.5 $3,100 $457,250 

Hobbs Unit 3 73.1 $3,300 $241,230 

Hobbs Unit 4 102.5 $3,300 $338,250 

Hobbs Unit 5 61.1 $3,500 $213,850 

Hobbs Unit 6 32.3 $3,800 $122,740 

Hobbs Unit 7 52.5 $3600 $189,000 

Hobbs Unit 8 40.0 $3,800 $152,000 

Authorized Signature 

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020 
 
 
 
 
 
 

NWFWMD Request for Quotes –July 2020 Recovery Efforts and Debris Reduction Clearance Services 
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QUOTE SHEET 

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES 

Company: 

Quote Prepared by: 

Date: 

Unit Name Contract Acres per acre rate unit total 

Altha Unit 1 92.2 
Altha Unit 2 1.7 
Altha Unit 3 12.9 
Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree 
Removal* 12.5 

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8 
Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 
Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1 
Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3 
Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1 
Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0 
Hobbs Unit 2 147.5 
Hobbs Unit 3 73.1 
Hobbs Unit 4 119.1 
Hobbs Unit 5 61.1 
Hobbs Unit 6 32.3 
Hobbs Unit 7 52.5 
Hobbs Unit 8 40.0 
Authorized Signature 

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020 

Graham County Land Company, LLC.

Randy Jordan, Owner/Managing Member

August 14, 2020

$2800.00

$2800.00

$2800.00

$29,000.00

$6500.00
$25,000.00

$6500.00
$6500.00

$6500.00

$2,600.00
$2,600.00

$2,600.00

$2,600.00
$2,600.00
$2,600.00
$2,600.00
$2,600.00

$10,000.00*lump sum bid

*lump sum bid

*lump sum bid

$258,160.00
$4,760.00

$36,120.00

$31,200.00

$26,650.00

$170,950.00

$33,150.00

$330,200.00

$383,500.00
$190,060.00

$309,660.00
$158,860.00
$83,980.00

$136,500.00
$104,000.00

mailto:Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com
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REVISED QUOTE SHEET (August 12, 2020) 

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES  

Company: 

Quote Prepared by: 

Date: 

Unit Name 
Contract 

Acres 
per acre rate unit total 

Altha Unit 1  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 92.2     

Altha Unit 2  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 1.7     

Altha Unit 3  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 12.9     

Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree Removal* 12.5 *lump sum bid   

        

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8     

Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 *lump sum bid   

Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1     

Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3     

Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1     

Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 *lump sum bid   

        

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0    

Hobbs Unit 2 147.5    

Hobbs Unit 3 73.1    

Hobbs Unit 4 102.5     

Hobbs Unit 5 61.1     

Hobbs Unit 6 32.3     

Hobbs Unit 7 52.5     

Hobbs Unit 8 40.0     

Authorized Signature 

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020 

F4 Tech

Richard Davis

8/14/2020

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

$1,749.50
$1,749.50
$1,749.50

$1,749.50
$1,749.50
$1,749.50
$1,749.50
$1,749.50

$222,186.50
$258,051.25
$127,888.45

$179,323.75
$106,894.45
$56,508.85
$91,848.75
$69,980.00

The prices for the Hobbs units are good only if awarded to all 8 units. Otherwise each Hobbs
Unit is a NO BID.  We plan on using in-woods chipping of all material that can be skidded to a
landing and processed as either biomass or clean chips.  The remaining material will 
be raked, piled and burned on site with bulldozers and rubber tire front end loaders
with rakes.  

mailto:Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com
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REVISED QUOTE SHEET (August 12, 2020) 

NWFWMD JULY 2020 RECOVERY EFFORTS AND DEBRIS REDUCTION CLEARANCE SERVICES  

Company: 

Quote Prepared by: 

Date: 

Unit Name 
Contract 

Acres 
per acre rate unit total 

Altha Unit 1  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 92.2     

Altha Unit 2  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 1.7     

Altha Unit 3  (Note: Altha units 1, 2, and 3 will 

be awarded to a single contractor) 12.9     

Altha Unit 4: Hazard Tree Removal* 12.5 *lump sum bid   

        

Blue Spring Cleanup 4.8     

Blue Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 3.3 *lump sum bid   

Williford Spring Cleanup 4.1     

Strickland Road Cleanup 26.3     

Pitt Spring Cleanup 5.1     

Pitt Spring Hazard Tree Removal* 0.6 *lump sum bid   

        

Hobbs Unit 1 127.0    

Hobbs Unit 2 147.5    

Hobbs Unit 3 73.1    

Hobbs Unit 4 102.5     

Hobbs Unit 5 61.1     

Hobbs Unit 6 32.3     

Hobbs Unit 7 52.5     

Hobbs Unit 8 40.0     

Authorized Signature 

Please submit this sheet to: Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com 5:00 pm ET on August 14, 2020 

Merit First, LLC

Michael Martin

8/14/20

$1,585.00 $146,137.00

$2,260.00 $3,842.00

$2,260.00 $29,154.00
$38,200.00

NQ NQ

NQ NQ

$2,260.00 $59,438.00
NQ NQ

$28,550.00

$11,600.00

$1,575.00 $200,025.00
$1,575.00

$1,575.00
$1,800.00

$232,312.50
$131,580.00
$161,437.50

$1,975.00 $120,672.50
$2,260.00
$2,000.00
$2,260.00

$72,998.00
$105,000.00

$90.400.00

mailto:Agency.Clerk@nwfwater.com
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