AWARD Bid Tabulation sheet RFQ March 28, 2022- Hurricane Recovery Efforts and Debris reduction Clearance Services and Road Repairs- Bids Due 10 am EST, Friday April 1, 2022
AWARD IF ADDITIONAL FUNDS AVAILABLE BID #1 BID #2 BID #3 BID#4 BID#5 NO QUOTE RESPONSES
_ COLLINS LAND SERVICES, INC. CUSTOM TREE CARE, INC MERIT FIRST, LLC MOHAWK VALLEY MATERIALS WILDLANDS SERVICES, INC.
(LIST CONTRACTORS BELOW)
Wnr!( Group/ Contract Acres L QT D Per Acre Unit Total # Days to (Eomplete Per Acre Unit Total # Days to . Per Acre Unit Total # Days to (Eomplete Per Acre Unit Total # Days to . Per Acre Unit Total # Days to |1 PROMISE HABITAT sERVICES
Lhithame Rate Unit Rate Complete Unit Rate Unit Rate Complete Unit Rate Complete Unit
Unit #
Ten Mile West 135.00 WO D T RO $2,387.33 $322,289.55 36.0 $6,050.00 $816,750.00 61.0 $1,762.50 $237,937.50 55.0 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2. AFTERMATH DISASTER RECOVERY
1 (Preserve Residual Trees)
ScottRd. 83.00 eyt sl e $2,387.33 $210,085.04 24.0 $6,050.00 $532,400.00 61.0 $1,762.50 $155,100.00 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3. SOUTHERN DISASTER RECOVERY
2 (Preserve Residual Trees)
Work Group/ Work Type Work Operation Instructions N/A Lump Sum Bid # Days to . N/A Lump Sum Bid # Days to . N/A Lump Sum Bid # Days to : N/A Lump Sum Bid # Days to . N/A Lump Sum Bid # Days to ) 4. GASTON TREE RECYCLING
Unit Name (All Items Below) Complete Unit (All Items Below) Complete Unit (All Items Below) Complete Unit (All Items Below) Complete Unit (All Items Below) Complete Unit
Unit #
Blue Springs Hazardous Tree Cut & Remove (1) Dead Standing Oak- (Along Entrance Rd on Left)
5 Campgroud Removal Cut & Remove 1 Water Oak and 1 dead snag behind Campsite #2 Site Marker N/A $3,000.00 10 N/A 35 N/A ZEente 10 N/A NOBID NOBID N/A $11,250.00 3.0 ° BREAK N GROUND
——— Hazardous Tree & Cut & Remove (7) Dead Live Oak Trees (Avg DBH 24") throughout campgrounc
c:'a“ w:z Vegetative Debris Remove Dead Vegetative Debris at Campground Entrance N/A $8,000.00 15 N/A $15,400.00 35 N/A $6,370.00 1.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A $17,500.00 5.0 6. BRIZO CONSTRUCTION LLC
4 PEr Removal debris consists of logs and brush (approx 20 Cubic Yards)
STEET: e Cut & Leave In Place (8) dead standing snags along boardwalk to Canoe Launch (Mixed DBH)
Note- Work is Located in Wetland. N/A $8,000.00 1.0 N/A $17,600.00 35 N/A $6,240.00 1.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID 7. CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC.
Canoe Launch Removal . .
Several Trees are hanging over or adjacent to boardwalks
5
Hazardous Tree Cut and Remove (1) Dead Pine Snag in front of Field Office & Grind stump below ground level
Econfina Field Office Removal & Debris Load and Haul Away approximately 120 Cubic Yards of Hurricane damaged Boardwalk Debris- Behind Econfina N/A $6,500.00 2.0 N/A $13,200.00 3-5 N/A $13,000.00 3.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A $8,500.00 20 8. CROWDER GULF JOINT VENTURE, INC
G Removal Field Office
Pitt Springs Hazardous Tree Cut & Leave in Place (2) Hazardous Pine snags
D ey Removal Fpminy i e N/A $3,000.00 0.5 N/A $4,400.00 3-5 N/A $2,600.00 1.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A 1.0 9. DRC EMERGENCY SERVICES
7
Williford Sprin, T *Cut and Leave in Place (7) Dead standing (primarily oak) snags along entire boardwalk-
LIS from Williford Spring Overlook Platform, south to Water Access Platform N/A $6,500.00 20 N/A $15,400.00 3-5 N/A $7,800.00 2.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID
Day Use Area Removal
(DBH Range from 8"-24")
8
Rattlesnake Lake North Hazardous Tree *Cut & Remove all dead Live Oak Trees between day use recreation areas and campsite areas
9 Day Use and Camping Areas Removal Grind Al stumps below ground level. Approximately 20 trees with DBH between 10" to 50" N/A $30,000.00 50 N/A $44,000.00 35 N/A $20,800.00 30 N/A NOBID NOBID N/A NOBID NOBID
*Cut and Leave in Place approximately (10) dead standing snags in wetland on NorthEast side of Bridge
Hazardous Tree N i R A — . N -
e ey Remove all dead Vegetative Debris and Piles within 50' of roadway from NE side of Bridge to Campsite
" . . . |*Cut & Remove (2) Large Pines and 1 Large Oak Adjacent to Walsingham Campsite Area (uplands) (1 pine is acros| N/A $30,000.00 5.0 N/A $28,600.00 35 N/A $20,085.00 4.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A 5.0
(Walsingham Bridge to Walsingham Park Area) Vegetative Debris ; - § ) .
— roadway North of restroom; other is approximately 50-75' feet SE of campsite) (Oak is adjacent to Canoe Launch!
10
*Cut & Remove (12) dead Longleaf Pine Trees along both sides of roadway from Longleaf/Seashell Entrance up t
(Mah:"::':""‘:‘f::‘;’e':":::" ] Hazardous Tree and including Longleaf Campsite N/A $10,000.00 2.0 N/A $26,400.00 35 N/A $8,645.00 1.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID
1 P (Trees have 12"-24" DBH and are approximately 80'-100' tall)
Walsingham Bridge Rd. M. *Cut & Remove (8) dead Longlef Pines along both sides of roadway from Longleaf Campsite to Seashell use area|
Main Road from Longleaf Removal including Seashell Campsite (Trees have approximately 24" DBH and are approximately 80'-100' tall) N/A $10,000.00 15 N/A $17,600.00 35 N/A $9,100.00 1.0 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID
» to Seashell Campsite * Remove debris pile of dead trees and mixed vegetative debris adjacent to creek (approx 20-40 CY)
*Cut & Remove approximately (23) dead Longleaf Pines & (3) Oak Trees along both sides of roadway from
Seashell Use Area to Devils Hole Use Area
Walsingham Bridge Rd Hazardous Tree *Cut and Remove all dead standing, lying and underwater trees and dead vegetative debris greater than 3" in
(Main Road from Seashell Removal & diameter within the Devils Hole Swimming Area and within a distance of 75' around the vegetative buffer
to Devils Hole) Including Devils Hole Swimming Areaand | Vegetative Debris surrounding Devils Hole. N/A $75,000.00 200 N/A $107,800.00 35 N/A $26,195.00 70 N/A NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID
Campsite Removal * Cut and Remove all dead standing, lying and underwater trees and dead vegetative debris greater than 3" in
diameter within the Karst Feature (wetland area between Devils Hole Restroom and the Devils Hole Campsite an
within a distance of 50' around the vegetative buffer surrounding the Karst Feature).
13
Lump Sum Bid Price Per Ton for all Price Per Ton for all Price Per Ton for all Price Per Ton for all Lump Sum Bid Price Per Ton for all
i Work completed and # | Wwork completed Wwork completed and # | Wwork completed work completed and |
Complete Road repairs to 4700 Feet of Mable Porter Rd. work completed and # work completed work completed and # work completed work completed and
(Labor and Approximately 3300 Tons of Material) of Days to Complete and # of Days to of Days to Complete and # of Days to # of Days to
*Repair washouts by pulling all available loose fill material from lower sections of roadway back into washout Complete Complete Complete
areas. 147.33 TON $47.49 TON
A . . .
A Rap— R N Insﬁall l:’zater turr;g;t: to re:n'ect Yvaterlfr:rgorga:way zj dlr:cltesdl bthDIj.str\c;Stii(f;. B N/A 35 DAYS N/A $136.81/TON N/A N/A $57.13 TON N/A NO BID
et e e e 0 Tl (AT lve e B L e L) €l D 1 (e e o el $290,400.00 (SEE NOTE) $451,440.00 $156,720.00 21 DAYS $188,529.00 NO BID
remaining washouts back to existing grade 90 DAYS 10 DAYS
*Provide and Spread 3000 Tons (Approximately 3000 Cubic Yards) of 1-3 Inch Limerock along entire length of
road section (4,700 feet) and spread 12' wide by 4" thick
14
(Units 1 & 2) Assuming your company receives a Task Order and Notice to Proceed by April 10, 2022 Enter the number of acres this company can complete by June 10, 2022. (Please note that
a the contractor will be required to provide a performance bond equal to 25% of the Task Order Amount to gaurantee the work completion by the date provided. No Extensions will be Given) 223 ACRES 61 223 ACRES NO BID, N/A NO BID, N/A
(Units 3-14) Assuming your company receives a Task Order and Notice to Proceed by April 10, 2022 for the above listed Tree Removal or Debris Removal or Road Projects, please list the Unit #'s
Q2 that your company can complete by June 10 (Please note that the contractor will be required to provide a performance bond equal to 25% of the Task Order Amount to gaurantee the work ALL UNITS 3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13 AND 14 61 UNITS 3-14 {ALL} UNIT # 14 3,4,6,7,10
completion by the date provided. No Extensions will be Given)
Uit 13- Our
Tump sum, we estimate the
o to take between 1000-1400 tons. 4700x1244" is about 980 tons,not 3000 tons. Since the RFQ says
OTHER NOTES/CONTRACTOR COMMENTS the ob will b peid per ton, we had to account for it both ways on the sheet, f we are awarded this
work with the if
possible. " » therelis. of atime
frame
** THIS TABLE REFLECTS THE QUOTES RECEIVED FOR THE MARCH 28, 2022 RFQ FOR "Hurricane Recovery Efforts and Debris reduction Clearance Services and Road Repairs" Other pre qualified vendors were non-responsive




